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In his report dated 10 September 2006, Dr Elliman set out his criticisms of
both your reports. He stated that you had been selective in your choice of
references and your quotations from them, and that the conclusions drawn by
you from the references frequently did not accord with the conclusions
reached by the author and/or researcher. Dr Elliman also criticised your
apparent misinterpretation and/or misunderstanding of the references to
winch you referred and stated that the type of source material referred to by
YOu i your reports was sometimes not appropnate as a primary source for a
report such as you were asked to provide.

Bearing m mind all of the circumstances outlined above. the Panel went on to
consider each of the outstanding allegations against you. Mr Kark, on behalf
of the GMC, told the Panel that this case is not concerned with the efficacy of
vaccines nor with the risks and benefits associated with them. Furthermore,
the Panel was told that the case was not concerned with vaccination policy.
The Legal Assessor advised the Panel that it must decide whether what you
did when writing your reports was to give false and/or misleading impressions
of the research you relied on, whether how you did that was by quoting
selectively and omitting information, whether why you did it was because you
unwittingly allowed your deeply held views to overrule your duty and whether,
therefore, you failed to be objective, independent and unbiased.

Against this background, the Panel went on to consider each of the

outstanding allegations against you.

THE ALLEGATIONS
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The Panel considered it important to recognise that the GMC did not allege
that you acted dishonestly.

The Panel has had regard to the duties of expert witnesses as brought to their
attention by the GMC and the defence. You stated that you were aware at the
time of the contents of Good Medical Practice 2001. Paragraph 51 states




